
 

EXISTING:  

25 U.S.C. § 5373 

(a) In general 
(1) Promulgation 
Not later than 90 days after October 21, 2020, the Secretary shall initiate procedures 
under subchapter III of chapter 5 of Title 5 to negotiate and promulgate such regulations 
as are necessary to carry out this subchapter. 

 
(2) Publication of proposed regulations 
Proposed regulations to implement this subchapter shall be published in the Federal 
Register not later than 21 months after October 21, 2020.* 

 
(3) Expiration of authority 
The authority to promulgate regulations under paragraph (1) shall expire on the date that 
is 30 months after October 21, 2020.** 

 
* July 21, 2022 
**     April 21, 2023 

 

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:   

 

An Act 

To amend title 25, United States Code, to extend the deadline for promulgation of regulations 
implementing the Practical Reforms and Other Goals to Reinforce the Effectiveness of Self-

Governance and Self-Determination for Indian Tribes Act of 2019. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America 
in Congress assembled. 

SECTION 1. EXTENSION OF DEADLINE FOR PROMULGATION OF REGULATIONS 
IMPLEMENTING THE PRACTICAL REFORMS AND OTHER GOALS TO REINFORCE 
THE EFFECTIVENESS OF SELF-GOVERNANCE AND SELF-DETERMINATION FOR 
INDIAN TRIBES ACT OF 2019. 

Section 5373 of the title 25, United States Code, is amended— 

(1) in subparagraph (a)(2) by striking “21 months” and inserting “35 months”;  
and 

(2) in subparagraph (a)(3) by striking “30 months” and inserting “47 months”.  

 

(1) July 21, 2022   to September 21, 2023 
(2) April 21, 2023 to September 21, 2024 
 


